
BID RESULTS

BID #

BID DATE/ TIME

NUMBER OF BIDDERS 4

NAME OF BIDDER
ADDRESS

CITY, STATE, ZIP
CONTACT
TELEPHONE

EMAIL
OWNERSHIP DISCLOSURE
RUSSIA CERT
IRAN CERT
NEW JERSEY BRC x x x N
EXPERIENCE AND QUALIFICATIONS x x x x

MTE Hydraulics Inc Campbell Freightliner Gabrielli Truck Sales Atlantic Towing and Recovery Inc.

LUMP SUM PRICE
BASE BID

ORGANIZATION:

24-39 Auto Repair Bid
1/7/2025 at 10:00am

MTE Hydraulics Inc Campbell Freightliner Gabrielli Truck Sales
Atlantic Towing and Recovery

Inc.
1915 Parkview drive, 1015 Cranbury South River Road 880 S. Oyster Bay Road 230 W Forest Ave

Roselle, New Jersey, 07203 Monroe, New Jersey, 08831 Hicksville, New York, 11801 Englewood, New Jersey, 07631

United States United States
9176593776 7322871500 5169317915 ext. 4483 2015675330

x x x x

industrial@mtehydraulics.net jpryslak2@campbellfreightliner.com jdenigris@gabriellitruck.com Kross201@gmail.com

x x x x

x x x x

Passenger Vehicles

SUV/ Trucks

Super Duty Trucks/ Vans

On road heavy Trucks

Specialty Vehicles

Off Road Vehicles

no bid
Standard Labor Rate $50.00 $95.00
Preventative maint rate $60.00 $95.00
Markup on parts 5% 25%

no bid no bid
Standard Labor Rate $50.00 $95.00
Preventative maint rate $60.00 $95.00
Markup on parts 5% 25%

no bid no bid
Standard Labor Rate $60.00 $110.00
Preventative maint rate $70.00 $110.00
Markup on parts 5% $25.00

Standard Labor Rate $100.00 $199.00 $225.00 $120.00

Preventative maint rate $120.00 $150.00

Fixed PM Rate, Class 3/4/5, Labor &
Parts: $595.00*

Fixed PM Rate, Class 6/7, Labor & Parts:
$800.00*

Fixed PM Rate, Class 8, Labor & Parts:
$995.00* $120.00

Markup on parts 5% 25.00% 45.00% 25.00%

no bid no bid

Standard Labor Rate $70.00 $225.00 $130.00
Preventative maint rate $80.00 $225.00 $130.00
Markup on parts 5% 45% 25%

no bid no bid
Standard Labor Rate $100.00 $130.00
Preventative maint rate $120.00 $130.00
Markup on parts 5% 25%


